_ CITY OF WHITE BEARLAKE
RAMBLER REVOLUTION PROJECT

_ BID OPENING: FRIDAY. FEBRUARY.25,2011 10:00 AM..

BASE BID 7 Alterhgté 1 Al?éljnatc 25' Akltckrnat’e 2b ) k’ Altc;ngtc Zfa : Alicrnatg 3b 1 - S . | GREEN STAR ' - Alternate 1 Altérnate 2a - Alternate 2b ; Alternate 33 ’Altérbate 3b
Received | Remodeling & Expansion of Rough jn Bed & Bath Finish Bed & Baih L Deck with treated ’ TOTAL | Remodeling & Exp;uision of o : ) i{ough in Bg(i &Bath |  Finish Bed & Bath : T beck with tre’aiedk TOTAL GREEN STAR
Additional Main Level, Cleanup - | FrontPorch - in Basement _“inBasement - | Deck as specified | lumber (with Deck Opﬁon 3a) Main Level, Cleanup -~ ' 'Fro,nt Porch iVnkBascI‘nent : ) in Basement Deck as specjﬁcd lumber. i
Information . ‘Basement : ' L Ao : . Basement : ‘ : : A I

Amen Construction $ 110,710.00 | $ 5,196.00 | § 4,566.00 | $ 3,648.00 | $ 998.00 | $ 920.00 | $ 125,118.00 | $ 106,150.00 | $ 5,196.00 | $ 428200 | § 3,494.00 { $ 998.00 | $ 92000 | § 120,120.00
Kipp Goodwiler, Inc. $ 75,307.00 | $§  7,120.00 | § 4,662.00 | $ 12,030.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ (2,100.00) $ 101,619.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid
Husnik Homes, Inc. $ 89,389.69 1% 986529 1% 749149 | § 12,564.00 | $ 2,480.69 | § 2,209.00 | $ 121,791.16 | § 99,095.69 | $ 10,523.48 | § 7,55849 | § 12,971.80 No Bid NoBid | § 130,149.46
GP & Sons No Bid
Procraft Homes No Bid
Robert Homes, Inc. No Bid
Rossbach Construction Yes $ 154,361.00 | $ 1891000 | § 5,021.00 | $ 18,353.00 | $ 4,625.00 | $ 2,885.00 | $ 201,270.00 | § 164,480.00 | $ 18,910.00 | § 5,021.001 % 18,353.00 | $ 4,625.00 1 § 2,885.00 | % 211,389.00
Cobra Construction No Bid
Rust Architects No Bid
Kraemer Construction No Bid
Crockett & Crockett $ 66,400.00 | $ 9,300.00 | § 4,300.00 | § 8,900.00 | § 3,100.00 | § 2,500.00 | $ 92,000.00 Discussion $800 - $4,000
Scherman Building Co. No Bid
Cymba Says Sales No Bid
Cardinal Remodeling No Bid
Croix Custom Homes $ 79,536.00 | § 5,854.00 | § 2,350.00 | $ 5,690.00 | § 3,390.00 | § 2,828.00 | $ 96,820.00 | $ 87,171.00 | § 5,854.00 | $ 2,35000 | § 7,540.00 | $ 3,390.00 | $ 2,828.00 | § 106,305.00
Southwind Builders No Bid $ .
Mersch Construction No Bid $ -
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Date Dan Holzem;»,’ﬁngineering Techiitian 1V Samantha Crosby, Associate Planner




